
Gathering the Givers of the Retreat in Daily Life  
Resources Mentioned in the Chat 
 
18th and 9th Annotation Resources 
 
Draw Me Into Your Friendship: A Literal Translation and a Contemporary Reading of the 
Spiritual Exercises (Jesuit Sources)  
 
The Ignatian Adventure: Experiencing the Spiritual Exercises of St. Ignatius in Daily Life by: 
Kevin O'Brien, SJ (Loyola Press)  
 
Choosing Christ in the World: A Handbook for Directing the Spiritual Exercises of St 
Ignatius Loyola According to Annotations Eighteen and Nineteen (Jesuit Sources)  
 
The Spiritual Exercises Reclaimed [Anniversary Edition] Uncovering Liberating Possibilities 
for Women by Elizabeth Liebert & Annemarie Paulin-Campbell (Paulist Press) 
 
Understanding the Spiritual Exercises by Michael Ivens, SJ (Gracewing)  
 
Like the Lightning: The Dynamics of the Ignatian Exercises by David Fleming, SJ (Jesuit 
Sources)   
 
Inner Compass An Invitation to Ignatian Spirituality by Margaret Silf (Loyola Press) 
 
Hearts on Fire Praying with Jesuits by Michael Harter, SJ (loyola Press)  
 
The First Spiritual Exercises Four Guided Retreats by Michael Hansen, S.J. (Ave Maria 
Press) 
 
Finding Christ in the World : A Twelve Week Ignatian Retreat in Everyday Life by Joseph 
Tetlow, SJ and Carol Atwell Ackels (Jesuit Sources)  
 
Moment by Moment A Retreat in Everyday Life by Carol Ann Smith, S.H.C.J. and  Eugene 
Merz, S.J. (Ave Maria Press) 
 
William O’Malley SJ’s book “The Fifth Week” has been helpful for follow-up 
 
Timothy Gallagher's book, "Introduction to Ignatian Prayer" is helpful for follow-up 
 
The Gift of Spiritual Intimacy by Monty Williams to be a tremendous resource. 
 
Putting on the Virtue of Christ Gerald Fagin SJ 
 
Discovering your personal Vocation, Herbert Alphonso SJ 
 



On Earth as it is in Heaven by Josephine Lombardi. 
 
May I have this Dance by Joyce Rupp 
 
Dynamics of the Spiritual Exercises by Howard Gray, SJ 
https://president.georgetown.edu/initiatives/spiritual-exercises/ 
 
Context of healing prayer: article by myself, Penelope Olive, Models for Healing Prayer in 
Spiritual Direction - The Healing Ministry of Jesus; the Passion of Christ; the Consecration - 
The Way Journal  January 2015 
 
Only Your Love and Your Grace: On Directing the Spiritual Exercises of St. Ignatius of 
Loyola by Robert Fabing, SJ 
 
A Friendship Like No Other: Experiencing God’s Amazing Embrace by William A. Barry 
 
The New Spiritual Exercises In the Spirit of Pierre Teilhard de Chardin; Louis Savary 

CLC (Christian Life Community) is a seamless, blessed movement for those who’ve made 
the SE for on-going faith sharing, integrating the SE as 5th Week into the rest of their lives 
as contemplative men and women on mission in the world. If any one is interested to 
explore starting new CLCs in your area, please be in touch via the national website clc-
usa.com or happy to have more conversation: teacher41@aol.com 
 
https://feelingswheel.com/ 
 
Resources for Supervision 

Lori Wilson: I’m a supervisor as well,  connected with the MURPHY CENTER for Ignatian 

Spiritual direction.  My email is lorijean.wilson@gmail.com. 

Laura Pasquale, lep@scforyou.com 

Our AASEA Group (Atlantic Association of Spiritual Exercises Apostolate) , Saint John, New 

Brunswick, Canada build in peer supervision at all of our local meetings.  It is a non-

negotiable for us. 

I also am offering supervision for the Exercises.  Contact - Paul Burgmayer 

pburgmayer@gmail.com 

Alice Nahas: Individual and group supervision: purplehabit.com, anahas@me.com.     

Christian Life Community provides Guide Training, Communities, Peer Supervision for CLC 

members in our Bridges Program (19th Annot) and with the Online Program offered in 

several language (also 19th Annotation) clc-usa.com is national website; cvx-clc.net is world 

website; you can also contact me Teacher41@aol.com for further conversation 

https://president.georgetown.edu/initiatives/spiritual-exercises/
mailto:teacher41@aol.com
https://feelingswheel.com/


Multi-Cultural Resources 

La Universidad de Comillas has many books in Spanish for Salterrae Publishers 

Jesuits in Pune, India: https://www.punejesuit.org/ 

Francis X. Clooney, SJ, is good on Hinduism 

I am an area coordinator with Ignatian Spirituality Project retreats. I facilitate the ISP 

weekend retreats and I and others bring Ignatian Spirituality reflections to shelters and one-

on-one. I'd be happy to tell you my experiences. sherryalexander@outlook.com More info 

on ISP at Home - Ignatian Spirituality Project (ispretreats.org) 

OIS (Ministerio Hispano Ignaciano) is partnering with "Casa Kino" from San Diego 

(www.casakino.org). OIS' Hispanic Ministry Team has many resources that could be helpful: 

www.MinisterioHispanoIgnaciano.org Feel free to contact them. 

Carlos Cabarrús, sj, was a Novice Master for the Jesuits for many years. He accompanied 

young men who had significant traumas from the realities of Central America in the 

80s/90s. He developed an approach to accompaniment in a book.  Here is a page with his 

books https://www.edesclee.com/autor/carlos-rafael-cabarrus 

Various papers about Ignatian Spirituality in Spanish 

https://www.cristianismeijusticia.net/es/eides 

Patrick Saint-Jean (young, Hatian Jesuit): The Crucible of Racism: Ignatian Spirituality and 

the Power of Hope. Within his own context, he moves through the major themes of all four 

weeks of the Exercises. He has several great books that apply.  

Anti-Racism Sodality of the Midwest Province has developed terrific resources for the their 

annual retreat: The God of Us All: Praying with Black and Ignatian Spirituality. 

A book by Trevor Hudson "Seeking God: Finding Another Kind of Life with St. Ignatius and 

Dallas Willard" is a great perspective from a Methodist minister for me a s a Catholic 

working with ecumenical groups. 

Loyola House in Guelph Canada has several programs and was the home of John Veltri 
and John English. https://ignatiusguelph.ca/ 
 

Guidelines and Reflective Process  Resources for Givers of the Spiritual Exercises 
 
By Every Means Possible, Fr. General Arturo Sosa, SJ, Superior General, invites us to offer 
the Spiritual Exercises “in as many ways as possible.”  This document presents guidelines 
for those in the ministry of the Spiritual Exercises., including five characteristics of those 
who give the Spiritual Exercises. https://www.jesuitsmidwest.org/the-gift-of-the-spiritual-
exercises/ 
 
Mission Examen 

mailto:sherryalexander@outlook.com
https://ispretreats.org/
http://www.casakino.org/
https://ignatiusguelph.ca/


The Mission Examen is a suggested process designed to help claim and foster the specific 
charism of your retreat ministry. https://www.jesuitsmidwest.org/the-gift-of-the-spiritual-
exercises/ 
 
Resources for Training to Become a Giver of the Spiritual Exercises 
 
St. Raphaela Center: An Online Practicum in Giving the 19th Annotation for spiritual 
directors who have completed a spiritual direction formation program. 
https://www.straphaelacenter.org/spiritual-director-formation/ 
 
Boston College Intensive on the 19th Annotation, a week-long summer intensive offered 
through the School of Theology and Ministry for spiritual directors in order to better 
accompany others through the Spiritual Exercises, particularly in the 19th Annotation 
format. https://www.bc.edu/bc-web/schools/stm/academics/summer-at-
stm/19thAnnotationIntensive.html 
 
The Loyola Ignatian Formation Experience (LIFE), for individuals who have made the 
Spiritual Exercises and have discerned a call to the ministry of giving them. 
tbrown@loyola.edu 
 
The Archdiocese of New Orleans offers a three session program to give the Exercises. You 
must be a Spiritual Director and have gone through the Exercises in order to be in the 
program,  archspirctr@arch-no.org 
 
Multi year training at The Wickham Centre of the Ignatian Spirituality Centre of Montreal.  
Icsm-iscm. org - in English and/or French 
 
 
Contact Information for Ignatian Spiritual Exercises of Worcester 
 
Worcester RIDL website: www.IgnatianSpiritualExercisesWorcester.com 
Dick Kirk at dick.kirk@gmail.com or WorcSpEx19@gmail.coma support website for the 

Worcester RIDL program: findinggodindailylife.com 

Contact information for 19th annotation at Boston College Center for Ignatian 
Spirituality and St. Ignatius of Loyola Parish 
 
https://www.bc.edu/bc-web/offices/mission-ministry/sites/center-for-ignatian-
spirituality/prayer/19th-annotation.html 
 
https://www.stignatiuschestnuthill.org/ignatian-spirituality 
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